
THE NEW CONCEPT OF 

DIGITAL 
VULNERABILITY 
AND THE NEW RULES ON 

UNFAIR 
COMMERCIAL 
PRACTICES
BIO
Dr Eleni Kaprou is a lecturer in Business Law in 
Queen Mary University of London since 2022. 
Prior to that she held posts in Brunel University 
and Cardiff. She received her PhD in 2018 from 
the University of Nottingham. She has presented 
her work in numerous international conferences 
including the UK, Denmark, the Netherlands, 
Brazil, South America and elsewhere. Eleni has also 
served as a consultant on EU projects and taught 
on executive programmes for civil servants. She 
teaches commercial and consumer law as well as 
law of the digital markets and is the academic lead 
for the LLM in Commercial and Corporate Law. 
Eleni’s research interests lay in European private 
law with a focus on vulnerable subjects. She has 
written on consumer vulnerability, aggressive 
practices and retail financial services among others. 
Currently she is working on aggressive practices in 
the digital environment.

Dr Eleni Kaprou

Tuesday 20 February
TIme: 12:00 – 13:00  
Venue: Palmer Building,  
Room 106 (Whiteknights 
Campus)

To book your free place visit the online store  
CCLFR research seminar with Dr Eleni Kaprou

https://www.store.reading.ac.uk/conferences-and-events/faculty-of-arts-humanities-social-science/school-of-law/cclfr-research-seminar-with-dr-eleni-kaprou

